
Radio Three Sixty

Music For Strange Moments 

Welcome to the first 

newsletter from Radio Three 
Sixty. We wanted to com-

municate how much we ap-

preciate your support, help-

ing us reach 100,000 down-

loads. Also please keep 

emailing us where you like 

to listen to Radio Three 

Sixty.

We are lining up some 
great music for the upcom-

ing months, there is some 

great music out there which 

sadly never gets radio play, 

or placed on the front of 

music sites, and we hope we 

are helping turn you onto 

artists that your glad you 

found.

The Radio Three sixty 

website now has links to buy 

any of the music you hear on 

the show. Please goto 

www.radiothreesixty.com to 

support the artists.

As you may have heard 

itunes has changed the way 
it charts and shows pod-

casts, now the reviews and 

votes are a factor in the 

process not just download 

numbers. Please goto the 

Radio Three Sixty website 

and click on the Vote link.

If you get the podcast 

from another source like ya-

hoo or odeo, please vote for 
us there to.

Time to get back to mak-

ing the next podcast, thanks 

for taking the time to read 

this, we know how precious 

it is becoming. Enjoy the 

show.

THE FURZE - OUT NOW
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NEWS

2.1
MILESTONE - THANK 
YOU
Radio Three Sixty has 
passed 100,000 downloads. 
So thanks to everyone that 
supports the show.

2.2
THE FUTURE
As you will know we were 
doing a show every week, 
but securing music for a 
podcast is  tough, securing 
excellent music even harder. 
So we will be putting out a 
show every two weeks from 
now on.

2.3
ITUNES CHARTING 
itunes have changed the way 
they chart and show pod-
casts. Now reviews and 
votes are more important. 
Please vote for us on itunes, 
so we can keep our place 
and keep spreading the word 
about great hard to find mu-
sic.

info@radiothreesixty.com

WWW.RADIOTHREESIXTY.COM


